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Plaque detectors
   A GLOBAL phase III clinical trial of
Bayer’s new drug florbetaben has
found that the drug can be used to
detect the beta-amyloid plaques in
the brain, which are known to be
hallmark signs of Alzheimer’s.
   This discovery may in turn aid
doctors to diagnose Alzheimer’s
and start treating it earlier.
   Currently, Alzheimer's can only be
definitively confirmed through the
detection of amyloid plaques and/
or tangles in the brain during
autopsy after death or with a brain
tissue biopsy, however the new
method uses the drug florbetaben
as a tracer during a PET scan of the
brain to visualise amyloid plaques
during life.
   More than 200 people, who were
nearing death, including those with
suspected Alzheimer’s and those
without it, participated in the trial
which compared brain regions in
the PET scan to respective brain
regions after death during autopsy.
    A total of 186 brain regions from
these donors were analysed during
the study, along with 60 brain
regions from healthy volunteers.
   Based on these 246 brain regions
the study found florbetaben to
detect beta-amyloid with a sensitivity
of 77% and a specificity of 94%.

Piramal Imaging sale
   PIRAMAL Healthcare Limited has
announced it has entered into an
agreement with Bayer Pharma to
acquire worldwide rights to the
latter’s molecular imaging research
and development portfolio.
   The portfolio includes rights to
florbetaben, which is in the final
stages of its Phase III clinical trials.
   “We plan to build a promising
portfolio in the pharma space,
including our newly acquired
Molecular Imaging assets, which
will help us create a global branded
pharma business,” said Ajay
Piramal, Chairman of Piramal
Group.

Lescol generic
   THE US FDA has approved
marketing for Mylan
Pharmaceuticals’ fluvastatin
capsules USP, 20mg and 40mg, the
first generic version of Novartis’
Lescol capsules.
    The generic is indicated for the
treatment of both familial and
nonfamilial hypercholesterolemia
and mixed dyslipidemia, and is also
indicated for the secondary
prevention of cardiovascular
disease.

Smoking and knees
   SMOKING has been linked with
higher rates of knee replacement
failures, according to a new study.
   The Increased Revision Rates
Following Total Knee Arthroplasty in
Patients Who Smoke study looked
at 621 TKR patients, including 131
smokers (median age 62), and
found that the smoking group had
13 knee replacement failures (10%)
compared to five in the non-
smoking group (1%).
   The medical complication rate
(which included complications such
as DVT, blood clots, anemia, cardiac
problems and acute renal failure)
was also found to be "significantly
higher" in the smoking group, with
21% having a medical complication
compared to 12% of non-smokers.

New Victorian diabetes win
   PHARMACISTS in Victoria now
have a new way to aid their
patients with Type 2 Diabetes,
thanks to funding from Diabetes
Australia.
   The funding will enable the roll-
out of the type 2 diabetes
prevention program – Life!, for
Victorian pharmacists, which will
allow them a greater
engagement in the holistic
management of diabetes.
   The group based program is
designed to reduce the risk of
developing type 2 diabetes by
encouraging participants to set
behavioural goals and make
lifestyle changes based on the
adoption of an active lifestyle
and healthy diet.
   Life! also supports Victorians
with limited access to its program
by offering telephone health
coaching as an alternative to the
standard face to face workshops.
   Diabetes Australia’s Victorian
wing is offering a referral funding
agreement, to engage
pharmacists to encourage these
referrals into the Life! program,
for all registered pharmacists

practicing in Victoria.
  As such, whilst community
pharmacies are the primary sites
for screening, other non-premises
based practitioners such as
pharmacists conducting HMRs
are also encouraged to participate.
   For more details visit
www.diabetesrisk.org.au
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Weekly Comment

Welcome to Pharmacy Daily’s
weekly comment

feature.
This week’s

contributor is
Ivor North, Terry

White Chemists Human
Resources Manager

   Technology has transformed our
approach to almost everything we
do.
   The way we connect on a
personal level, how we do
business, the way we access
information - are just a few
examples of change afforded by
advances in technology.
   The application of technology to
training has had an enormous
impact for educational institutions
worldwide and particularly for
employers seeking to reach
decentralised workforces.
    At Terry White Chemists, new
technology is even allowing us to
invest in good old fashioned
service.
   Our web-based learning system
never sleeps.
   It offers 24 hour access from
anywhere in the world.
   Most importantly it delivers
improved staff outcomes and
professional pharmacy service.
   The fully integrated system links
with HR and payroll systems and
hosts an E-commerce site where
staff can access a suite of more
than 400 separate learning and
development training modules.
   Proving to be just what the
doctor ordered for Terry White
Chemists pharmacists and staff
out in the field, more than 12,000
training modules have now been
completed since we launched the
Online Training Academy in
August.
   In the busy retail pharmacy
environment it has not always
been easy to offer staff extended
opportunities for growth.
   By harnessing emerging
technology pharmacists are
taking a leap into the future,
delivering tangible results for their
pharmacy teams and improved
service for customers – the
ultimate goal.
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INTELLIGENT worry.
   US scientists have posited that
worrying may have evolved along
with intelligence as a beneficial
trait.
   The study found that high
intelligence and worry both
correlate with brain activity
measured by the depletion of the
nutrient choline in the subcortical
white matter of the brain, which,
according to study head Dr
Jeremy Coplan, Professor of
psychiatry at SUNY Downstate,
may mean that intelligence may
have co-evolved with worry.
   The study compared patients
with generalised anxiety disorder
with healthy patients to assess
the relationship among IQ, worry,
and subcortical white matter
metabolism of choline.
   In the healthy volunteers, high
IQ was associated with a lower
degree of worry, but in those
diagnosed with GAD, high IQ was
associated with a greater degree
of worry.

   MEDICINES Australia is urging the
Government to leave the R&D tax
credit which it introduced last year,
alone, following reports that the
Government may want to make
changes to the scheme.
   Speaking in the wake of the
rumours, Medicines Australia CE, Dr
Brendan Shaw said that winding
back the tax credit would
discourage investment in Australia
and would result in the loss of high
value research jobs.
   “Scaling back the R&D tax credit
would be extremely damaging to
R&D investment in Australia,” said
Shaw.
   “Such a move would put a brake
on investment at the very time
when policy makers are trying to
stimulate growth.
   “It would effectively add up to 10
per cent to the cost of investing in
Australian R&D and would put at
risk hundreds of high-skill, high-
wage research jobs,” he added.
   Currently, Australia attracts $1
billion per annum in
pharmaceutical R&D investment.
   The Government, according to

Medicines Australia, would risk
losing large chunks of this
investment if the tax credit were to
be reduced, with some companies
bound to withdraw their research
interests from the nation
altogether.
   Adding further fuel to the
argument, Shaw said that due to
the relatively new nature of the tax
credit, with it only having been
introduced less than a year ago, not
enough time has elapsed to be able
to see its benefits in terms of
investment.
   “The Government went through
an extensive consultative process in
developing the tax credit system to
replace the previous tax
concession, which was inefficient
and ineffective,” Shaw said.
   “To do a U-turn on such an
important policy measure after less
than a year would send quite the
wrong signal to the investment
community.
   “It would severely undermine
business confidence, send
investment offshore and threaten
Australian jobs,” he added.

MA: Leave the credit alone

   A PRANK played on a sleepy
Belgian town involving a medical
emergency, police, a football team
and a woman riding a motor cycle
in her underwear, has notched up
nearly 20 million hits on YouTube.
   The prank was executed to
promote a new European TV
channel, and began with the
planting of a podium in the town
square atop of which was a large
red button with an arrow pointing
towards it saying press here to
add drama.
   Once pressed a series of events
was set in motion, including the
arrival of an ambulance to collect
a man, who then rolls out of the
emergency vehicle on his stretcher,
followed by a cyclist who runs
into the van, which results in a
smack-down fight between the
cyclist and a paramedic, which
leads into a police shoot out and
a cameo by a woman in her
underwear speeding through the
town on a motorbike.
 To watch the clip CLICK HERE.
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